

BID TABULATION
 SOUTH BROWARD DRAINAGE DISTRICT
 70-HR POST STORM DEBRIS/TREE REMOVAL SERVICES
 (BID RESULTS HAVE NOT BEEN FULLY EVALUATED)

Thursday, June 09, 2016

COMPANY NAMES →	CUSTOM TREE CARE INC.			CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC.			T.F.R. ENTERPRISES, INC.			WEEKLEY ASPHALT PAVING, INC.		
	<u>CAPACITY/ SIZE</u>	<u>REGULAR TIME/HR.</u>	<u>O.T./HR.</u>	<u>CAPACITY/ SIZE</u>	<u>REGULAR TIME/HR.</u>	<u>O.T./HR.</u>	<u>CAPACITY/ SIZE</u>	<u>REGULAR TIME/HR.</u>	<u>O.T./HR.</u>	<u>CAPACITY/ SIZE</u>	<u>REGULAR TIME/HR.</u>	<u>O.T./HR.</u>
HOURLY RATE FOR CREW - THREE (3) EXPERIENCED EMPLOYEES WITH CHAIN-SAWS, TRUCK CHIPPER & TREE CHIPPER	12"	\$325.00	\$475.00		\$318.00	\$367.00		\$375.00	\$487.50	PER CREW	\$324.00	\$486.00
TREE CHIPPER	12"	\$75.00	\$100.00	8"	\$88.00	\$137.00	12" Throat	\$100.00	\$125.00	8"	\$75.00	\$112.50
BOBCAT	1750 LBS +	\$75.00	\$100.00	1.5 CY	\$82.00	\$131.00	753	\$100.00	\$125.00	50 HP	\$75.00	\$112.50
COMBINATION		\$125.00	\$175.00	—	\$110.00	\$159.00	Attachment	\$150.00	\$175.00	80 HP	\$90.00	\$135.00
BOAT		\$200.00	\$300.00	Pontoon w/Motor	\$210.00	\$259.00	14' w/Motor	\$150.00	\$175.00	16'	\$200.00	\$300.00
CRANE	40 TON	\$225.00	NO BID	15 TON	\$185.00	\$234.00	30 TON	\$200.00	\$250.00	3/4 CY	\$160.00	\$240.00
GRAPPLE TRUCK	50 YD	\$200.00	\$300.00	—	\$165.00	\$214.00	45 CY	\$300.00	\$350.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
DUMP TRUCK		\$80.00	\$125.00	10-18 CY	\$92.00	\$141.00	16-20 CY	\$100.00	\$125.00	18 CY	\$75.00	\$112.50
BUCKET TRUCK	55' +	\$150.00	\$225.00	40'-60'	\$234.00	\$283.00	40'-60'	\$275.00	\$300.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CHIPPER TRUCK		\$75.00	\$100.00	—	\$102.70	\$151.70	8'-12' BED	\$75.00	\$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
DUMP TRAILER	25 YD +	\$100.00	\$125.00	24-40 CY	\$125.00	\$174.00	6-10 CY	\$125.00	\$150.00	22 CY	\$100.00	\$150.00
ADDITIONAL EMPLOYEES: SUPERVISOR		\$60.00	\$90.00		\$60.00	\$109.00		\$75.00	\$102.50		\$75.00	\$112.50
LABORER		\$40.00	\$60.00		\$39.00	\$58.50		\$50.00	\$75.00		\$48.00	\$72.00

COMPANY NAMES →	CUSTOM TREE CARE INC.			CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC.			T.F.R. ENTERPRISES, INC.			WEEKLEY ASPHALT PAVING, INC.		
CATEGORY/ITEMS	FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT PRICE
Vegetative Collect and Haul	0-5 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to Debris Management Site (DMS).	CY	<u>\$30.00</u>	0-5 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to Debris Management Site (DMS).	CY	<u>\$71.00</u>	0-5 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to Debris Management Site (DMS).	CY	<u>\$102.00</u>	0-5 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to Debris Management Site (DMS).	CY	<u>\$125.00</u>
	6-15 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$40.00</u>	6-15 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$72.50</u>	6-15 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$106.00</u>	6-15 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$135.00</u>
	16-30 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$50.00</u>	16-30 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$74.50</u>	16-30 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$115.00</u>	16-30 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$145.00</u>
	31-60 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$60.00</u>	31-60 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$76.50</u>	31-60 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$120.00</u>	31-60 Miles Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$155.00</u>
	Single Price Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul distance.	CY	<u>\$50.00</u>	Single Price Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul distance.	CY	<u>\$74.50</u>	Single Price Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul distance.	CY	<u>\$120.00</u>	Single Price Veg/Trees Remove and Collect from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul distance.	CY	<u>\$155.00</u>
Management and Reduction	Grinding			Grinding			Grinding			Grinding		
	Grinding/Chipping vegetative debris at DMS	CY	<u>\$3.25</u>	Grinding/Chipping vegetative debris at DMS	CY	<u>\$4.28</u>	Grinding/Chipping vegetative debris at DMS	CY	<u>\$4.15</u>	Grinding/Chipping vegetative debris at DMS	CY	<u>\$10.00</u>
C & D Collect and Haul	0-5 Miles Construction and Demolition (C&D) from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$40.00</u>	0-5 Miles Construction and Demolition (C&D) from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$79.00</u>	0-5 Miles Construction and Demolition (C&D) from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$105.00</u>	0-5 Miles Construction and Demolition (C&D) from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS.	CY	<u>\$125.00</u>
	6-15 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance up to 15 miles.	CY	<u>\$50.00</u>	6-15 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance up to 15 miles.	CY	<u>\$80.50</u>	6-15 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance up to 15 miles.	CY	<u>\$110.00</u>	6-15 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance up to 15 miles.	CY	<u>\$135.00</u>

COMPANY NAMES →	CUSTOM TREE CARE INC.			CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC.			T.F.R. ENTERPRISES, INC.			WEEKLEY ASPHALT PAVING, INC.		
	16-30 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance between 16 and 30 miles.	CY	<u>\$60.00</u>	16-30 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance between 16 and 30 miles.	CY	<u>\$82.50</u>	16-30 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance between 16 and 30 miles.	CY	<u>\$120.00</u>	16-30 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance between 16 and 30 miles.	CY	<u>\$145.00</u>
	31-60 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance between 31 and 60 miles.	CY	<u>\$70.00</u>	31-60 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance between 31 and 60 miles.	CY	<u>\$84.50</u>	31-60 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance between 31 and 60 miles.	CY	<u>\$130.00</u>	31-60 Miles C&D from Canals and Ditches and Transport to DMS. C&D collect and removal for a haul distance between 31 and 60 miles.	CY	<u>\$155.00</u>
	Single Price			Single Price			Single Price			Single Price		
	A single price C&D collect and removal for any haul distance.	CY	<u>\$60.00</u>	A single price C&D collect and removal for any haul distance.	CY	<u>\$82.50</u>	A single price C&D collect and removal for any haul distance.	CY	<u>\$140.00</u>	A single price C&D collect and removal for any haul distance.	CY	<u>\$155.00</u>
Final Disposal	0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.		
	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles.	CY	<u>\$5.00</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles.	CY	<u>\$4.95</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles.	CY	<u>\$5.50</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles.	CY	<u>\$125.00</u>
	6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.		
	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles.	CY	<u>\$6.00</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles.	CY	<u>\$5.85</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles.	CY	<u>\$7.75</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles.	CY	<u>\$135.00</u>
	16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles.	CY	<u>\$7.00</u>	16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles.	CY	<u>\$6.98</u>	16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles.	CY	<u>\$9.00</u>	16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles.	CY	<u>\$145.00</u>
	60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.			60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal.		
	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles.	CY	<u>\$8.00</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles.	CY	<u>\$8.95</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles.	CY	<u>\$11.00</u>	Transport processed debris from DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles.	CY	<u>\$190.00</u>
Specialty Removal	Vessel Removal (Marine)			Vessel Removal (Marine)			Vessel Removal (Marine)			Vessel Removal (Marine)		
	Removal of eligible vessel from waterway transport to DMS.	LF	<u>\$50.00</u>	Removal of eligible vessel from waterway transport to DMS.	LF	<u>\$88.00</u>	Removal of eligible vessel from waterway transport to DMS.	LF	<u>\$44.00</u>	Removal of eligible vessel from waterway transport to DMS.	LF	<u>\$140.00</u>
Bonding	Provide Performance and Payment Bond	LS	<u>\$ 2.5%</u>	Provide Performance and Payment Bond	LS	<u>\$0.00</u>	Provide Performance and Payment Bond	LS	<u>\$0.00</u>	Provide Performance and Payment Bond	LS	<u>\$ 3%</u>