

**BID TABULATION  
SOUTH BROWARD DRAINAGE DISTRICT  
CHEMICAL QUOTES**

**FOR FISCAL YEAR 2013-2014**

	<b>CLEAR ENERGY</b>	<b>HELENA</b>	<b>CPS</b>	<b>WINDFIELD</b>	<b>THATCHER</b>
<b>24-D</b>	\$18.38/Gal.	\$15.90/Gal.	\$15.40/Gal.	\$14.75/Gal.	No Bid
<b>BREWER 83-17/(Spreader 90)</b>	\$21.38/Gal.	\$12.50/Gal.	\$17.10/Gal.	No Bid	No Bid
<b>OPTIMA /(LI700)/(Breeze)</b>	\$23.75/Gal.	\$40.83/Gal.	\$24.60/Gal.	\$17.16/Gal.	No Bid
<b>DIQUAT /(Tribune)</b>	\$50.75/Gal.	\$39.79/Gal.	\$40.60/Gal.	\$39.73/Gal.	No Bid
<b>RENOVATE-3/(Element)</b>	\$124.68/Gal.	\$99.74/Gal.	99.74/Gal.	\$99.75/Gal.	No Bid
<b>PRO-MATE ACCURACY/ (Brace/Reign)</b>	\$21.50/Gal.	\$27.24/Gal.	\$17.20/Gal.	\$24.00/Gal.	No Bid
<b>PRO-MATE SINKER</b>	Discontinued	Discontinued	Discontinued	Discontinued	Discontinued
<b>AQUATHOL-K LIQUID</b>	\$78.58/Gal.	\$63.75/Gal.	\$62.86/Gal.	\$61.60/Gal.	No Bid
<b>HYDROTHOL-191 (LIQUID)</b>	\$78.00/Gal.	\$65.25/Gal.	\$65.18/Gal.	\$63.43/Gal.	No Bid
<b>NAUTIQUE</b>	\$43.20/Gal.	\$34.56/Gal.	\$34.56/Gal.	\$33.88/Gal.	No Bid
<b>SONAR AS/(AVAST)</b>	\$1,950.00/Gal.	\$1,902.36/Gal.	\$1,560.00/Gal.	\$1,830.44/Gal.	No Bid
<b>ADMIRAL/(Mystic Blue Lake)</b>	\$38.35/Gal.	\$29.65/Gal.	\$30.68/Gal.	\$34.00/Gal.	No Bid
<b>CAPTAIN</b>	\$20.13/Gal.	\$24.37/Gal.	\$16.10/Gal.	\$22.00/Gal.	No Bid
<b>KOMEEN LIQUID</b>	\$34.35/Gal.	\$27.63/Gal.	\$27.63/Gal.	\$26.96/Gal.	No. Bid
<b>SURFIX/(Attach)</b>	\$44.38/Gal.	\$50.96/Gal.	\$35.50/Gal.	No Bid	No Bid
<b>HABITAT/(Polaris)</b>	\$71.25/Gal.	\$66.45/Gal.	\$57.00/Gal.	\$67.42/Gal.	No Bid
<b>ARSENAL/(Polaris)</b>	\$71.25/Gal.	\$66.45/Gal.	\$57.00/Gal.	\$67.42/Gal.	No Bid
<b>RODED/(AQUAMASTER)</b>	\$24.50/Gal.	\$19.50/Gal.	\$19.60/Gal.	\$18.70/Gal.	No. Bid
<b>RAZOR PRO/(Makaze)</b>	\$21.25/Gal.	\$17.75/Gal.	\$17.00/Gal.	No Bid	No Bid
<b>FOAM BUSTER/(Unfoamer)</b>	\$16.13/Qt.	\$7.46/Pint	\$12.90/Qt.	No Bid	No Bid
<b>SECLEAR</b>	\$13.74/Gal.	\$10.99/Gal.	\$10.99/Gal.	\$10.84/Gal.	No. Bid
<b>COPPER SULFATE</b>	\$1.70/LB.	\$1.32/LB.	\$1.42/LB.	\$1.45/LB.	\$1.695/LB.
<b>HYDROTHOL-191 (PELLETS)</b>	\$3.55/LB.	\$2.96/LB.	\$2.84/LB.	\$2.72/LB.	No Bid
<b>SONAR-D</b>	\$1,441.20/40 LBS.	\$1,152.80/40 LBS.	\$1,152.80/40 LBS.	\$1,098.40/40 LBS.	No. Bid
<b>AQUATHOL SUPER K (PELLETS)</b>	\$20.13/LB.	\$15.68/LB.	\$16.10/LB.	No Bid	No Bid
<b>NAVIGATE</b>	\$3.58/LB.	\$3.05/LB.	\$2.86/LB.	No Bid	No Bid
<b>CLIPPER</b>	\$164.16/Gal.	\$131.33/Gal.	\$131.33/Gal.	No Bid	No Bid
<b>CUTRINE PLUS/ (Cutrine Plus Granular)</b>	\$2.40/LB.	\$17.24/Gal.	\$1.92/LB.	No Bid	No Bid
<b>KOMEEN CRYSTAL (PELLETS)</b>	\$281.20/20 LBS.	\$225.00/20 LBS.	\$225.00/20 LBS.	\$225.00/20 LBS.	No. Bid
<b>WIPEOUT TANK &amp; EQUIPMT. CLEANER</b>	\$3.63/LB.	\$13.25/Qt.	\$2.90/LB.	No Bid	No Bid