

FINAL BID TABULATION
 SOUTH BROWARD DRAINAGE DISTRICT
 70-HR POST STORM VAC TRUCK/DREDGER SERVICES
 THURSDAY, JUNE 09, 2016

COMPANY NAMES →	<i>SHENANDOAH GENERAL CONSTRUCTION CO.</i>			<i>INDUSTRIAL DIVERS CORP.</i>		
<u>EQUIPMENT</u>	<u>CAPACITY/SIZE</u>	<u>REGULAR TIME/HR.</u>	<u>O.T./HR.</u>	<u>CAPACITY/SIZE</u>	<u>REGULAR TIME/HR.</u>	<u>O.T./HR.</u>
VAC TRUCK W/EXPERIENCED OPERATOR & CREW	3,200 GALS.	\$ <u>225.00</u>	\$ <u>250.00</u>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
DREDGE BOAT W/EXPERIENCED OPERATOR & CREW	10' X 25'	\$ <u>250.00</u>	\$ <u>275.00</u>	6" - 1500 GPM	\$ <u>470.00</u>	\$ <u>611.00</u>
PORTABLE DREDGE W/EXPERIENCED OPERATOR & CREW	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	6" - 1500 GPM	\$ <u>385.00</u>	\$ <u>500.50</u>
TRACK HOE	60' LONG STICK	\$ <u>150.00</u>	\$ <u>150.00</u>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
COMBINATION	CAT 420	\$ <u>135.00</u>	\$ <u>155.00</u>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ADDITIONAL EMPLOYEES: SUPERVISOR		\$ <u>55.00</u>	\$ <u>75.00</u>	N/A	\$ <u>75.00</u>	\$ <u>97.50</u>
LABORER		\$ <u>38.00</u>	\$ <u>57.00</u>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CATEGORY	FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	FIELD NAME & DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT PRICE
<i>Material & Sand Collect and Haul</i>	<i>0-5 Miles Remove and Collect material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to Debris Management Site (DMS).</i>	CY	\$ <u>75.00</u>	<i>0-5 Miles Remove and Collect material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to Debris Management Site (DMS).</i>	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	<i>6-15 Miles Remove and Collect material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to DMS.</i>	CY	\$ <u>85.00</u>	<i>6-15 Miles Remove and Collect material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to DMS.</i>	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	<i>16-30 Miles Remove and Collect material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to DMS.</i>	CY	\$ <u>125.00</u>	<i>16-30 Miles Remove and Collect material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to DMS.</i>	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	<i>31-60 Miles Remove and Collect material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to DMS.</i>	CY	\$ <u>150.00</u>	<i>31-60 Miles Remove and Collect material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to DMS.</i>	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	<i>Single Price Remove material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul distance.</i>	CY	\$ <u>300.00</u>	<i>Single Price Remove material/sand/debris from Drainage Culverts and Structures and Transport to DMS. Removal for any haul distance.</i>	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
<i>Material & Sand Removal</i>	<i>Remove material/sand/debris from an 18" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.</i>	LF	\$ <u>5.00</u>	<i>Remove material/sand/debris from an 18" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.</i>	LF	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	<i>Remove material/sand/debris from a 24" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.</i>	LF	\$ <u>6.00</u>	<i>Remove material/sand/debris from a 24" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.</i>	LF	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	<i>Remove material/sand/debris from a 30" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.</i>	LF	\$ <u>7.00</u>	<i>Remove material/sand/debris from a 30" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.</i>	LF	\$ <u>52.35</u>
	<i>Remove material/sand/debris from a 36" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.</i>	LF	\$ <u>8.00</u>	<i>Remove material/sand/debris from a 36" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.</i>	LF	\$ <u>59.35</u>

FINAL BID TABULATION
 SOUTH BROWARD DRAINAGE DISTRICT
 70-HR POST STORM VAC TRUCK/DREDGER SERVICES
 THURSDAY, JUNE 09, 2016

COMPANY NAMES →	SHENANDOAH GENERAL CONSTRUCTION CO.			INDUSTRIAL DIVERS CORP.		
	Remove material/sand/debris from a 48" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>10.00</u>	Remove material/sand/debris from a 48" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>68.50</u>
	Remove material/sand/debris from a 54" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>50.00</u>	Remove material/sand/debris from a 54" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>89.00</u>
	Remove material/sand/debris from a 60" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>55.00</u>	Remove material/sand/debris from a 60" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>111.25</u>
	Remove material/sand/debris from a 72" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>75.00</u>	Remove material/sand/debris from a 72" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>127.25</u>
	Remove material/sand/debris from an 84" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>100.00</u>	Remove material/sand/debris from an 84" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>148.35</u>
	Remove material/sand/debris from a 96" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>150.00</u>	Remove material/sand/debris from a 96" Drainage Culvert and dispose material in the adjacent water body.	LF	\$ <u>178.00</u>
<i>Final Disposal</i>	0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed material/sand/debris from DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles.	CY	\$ <u>75.00</u>	0-5 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed material/sand/debris from DMS to final disposal 0-5 Miles.	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed material/sand/debris from DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles.	CY	\$ <u>85.00</u>	6-15 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed material/sand/debris from DMS to final disposal 6-15 Miles.	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed material/sand/debris from DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles.	CY	\$ <u>125.00</u>	16-30 Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed material/sand/debris from DMS to final disposal 16-30 Miles.	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
	60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed material/sand/debris from DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles.	CY	\$ <u>150.00</u>	60+ Miles from DMS to Final Disposal. Transport processed material/sand/debris from DMS to final disposal 60+ Miles.	CY	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
Bonding	Provide Performance and Payment Bond	LS	\$ <u>300.00</u>	Provide Performance and Payment Bond	LS	\$ <u>3%</u>
				ADDITIONAL:	REGULAR TIME/HR.	O.T./HR.
				FOUR DIVER TEAM:		
				SUPERVISOR, DIVER, STANDBY DIVER, & TENDER	\$225.00/Hr.	\$292.50/Hr.
				CCTV or HANDHELD HD CAMERA	\$250.00/Day	
				BURNING GEAR OR HYDRAULIC TOOL	\$350.00/Day	
				BURNING RODS	\$4.00/Each	
				BURNING OXYGEN	\$60.00/Bottle	