

**FINAL BID TABULATION**  
**SOUTH BROWARD DRAINAGE DISTRICT**

**REBUILDING OF STORMWATER PUMPS AT THE S-1 & S-7 PUMP STATIONS IN MIRAMAR**

**Tuesday, October 11, 2016**

COMPANY NAME	BIDS FOR - S-1 PUMP STATION # 3 PUMP			BIDS FOR - S-7 PUMP STATION # 3 PUMP			LUMP SUM FOR BOTH PUMPS
	BASE BID AMOUNTS	ALT. BID AMOUNTS		BASE BID AMOUNTS	ALT. BID AMOUNTS		
	#3 PUMP	NEW PROPELLER PER PUMP	REBLADING PROPELLER PER PUMP	#3 PUMP	NEW PROPELLER PER PUMP	REBLADING PROPELLER PER PUMP	TOTAL LUMP SUM FOR BOTH PUMPS (Not Including Alternates)
<i>CREEL PUMP INC.</i>	\$26,000.00	\$4,600.00	\$2,600.00	\$26,000.00	\$4,600.00	\$2,600.00	\$52,000.00
<i>MWI PUMP CORP.</i>	\$25,769.00	\$3,990.00	\$1,985.00	\$25,769.00	\$3,990.00	\$1,985.00	\$51,538.00
<b>FPI PUMPS, INC.</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>COMMENTS:</b>	<b>Contract Awarded to : MWI Pump Corp.</b> <b>For a total amount, not-to-exceed: \$59,518.00</b>						